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Freedom of Information Request 
 
Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request. 
 
Request / Response: 
 
Please note that the wheelchair service is not directly provided by the CCG, this is a 
commissioned service and is provided by North West Boroughs Healthcare NHS 
Foundation Trust. The CCG would not hold some of the information contained within 
this FOI and as such, we would ask that you contact the provider direct on the 
following: 
 
Information Governance & Clinical coding team 
Finance and Informatics Directorate 
North West Boroughs Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust 
Hollins Park House 
Winwick 
Warrington 
WA2 8WA 
 
Telephone:01925 664485 
E-mail foi@nwbh.nhs.uk  
 

A) Please list the wheelchair services provided by the CCG, including:  
 

i) The provider 
  
 As Above, North West Boroughs Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust. 

 
ii) The geographical area covered 
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Resident/registered with a Knowsley GP. 
 

iii) Brief description of the provision covered 
 

The service will assess clients’ long and short-term mobility needs and 
provide and maintain appropriate wheelchair, seating and accessories. 
 

iv) The need level met (i.e. low, end of life, hospital discharge, etc) 
 
All service users over the age of 36 months with a permanent mobility 
problem. 
 
Any child under 36 months who has significant postural problems where 
specialised seating is deemed medically necessary. 

 
B) For each instance where the answer to 'A i' is anything other than the CCG 

itself:  
 

i) The date when the related contract began  
 
This is a standard NHS rolling contract which has provision to review 
annually. The current contract started 01/04/2017 with a 2 year contract 
term. 
 

ii) The annual cost of the contract to the CCG 
 
Approximately £568,115 
 

iii) The annual cost of the service at the last point it was provided directly by the 
CCG 
 
This service has never directly been provided by the CCG. 
 

     iv) The date when the current contract will expire 
 
This contract expires on 31/03/2019, however as this is standard NHS 
contract there is yearly provision to extend. 

 
C) For each instance where the answer to 'A i' is the CCG 

 
i) The annual cost to the CCG of the service for each of the following  financial 

years: 2015/16, 2016/17, 2017/18 and 2018/19  
 
2015/16 £560,812 
2016/17 £566,981 
2017/18 £567,548 
2018/19 £568,115 
 

 
D) The following information about wheelchair service use  
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Please contact the provider direct for all the below information 

 
i) The current total longest open episode of care for (a) adults and (b) children, 

in weeks  
 
The CCG does not hold this information; please contact the provider 
directly for this. 
 

ii) The average waiting time in weeks for the following financial years: 2015/16, 
2016/17, 2017/18 and 2018/19 (up until the date on which this request is 
received)  

 
The CCG does not hold this information; please contact the provider 
directly for this. 
 

     iii) The total annual spend on wheelchair services for the following financial years 
2015/16, 2016/17, 2017/18 and 2018/19   

 
2015/16 £560,812 
2016/17 £566,981 
2017/18 £567,548 
2018/19 £568,115 
 

iii) The total number of complaints relating to wheelchair services received for the 
following financial years 2015/16, 2016/17, 2017/18 and 2018/19 (and the 
outcome of complaints if possible)  
 
The CCG does not hold this information; please contact the provider 
directly for this 

 


